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Why need to be Mohr By Frederick Reuss in this website? Obtain more profits as what we have told you.
You can discover the various other reduces besides the previous one. Reduce of obtaining guide Mohr By
Frederick Reuss as exactly what you want is likewise given. Why? We provide you numerous kinds of
guides that will certainly not make you feel bored. You could download them in the link that we supply. By
downloading Mohr By Frederick Reuss, you have actually taken properly to pick the ease one, as compared
to the trouble one.

From Publishers Weekly
Reuss follows up the antic infantilism of The Wasties (2002) with what might be called a documentary
historical. At the novel's center is the real-life German-Jewish novelist and playwright Max Mohr; exiled
from Germany in 1934, he chose to emigrate to China, leaving his wife, Käthe, and daughter, Eva, at their
Bavarian home, and working as a doctor (for which he was trained) as China's war with Japan raged. The
book is Reuss's explicit attempt to write Mohr back into the historical record and to understand his choices.
To that end, he includes 47 actual photographs of Mohr, his family and their surroundings (some of which
Reuss interprets), and Reuss also foregrounds his own place in the work. After an extended second-person
address, Reuss tells his character Mohr, "I say you, but I mean me. In novels, personal pronouns can be
misleading. This is not an easy idea to express, and some will call the notion absurd. But why not? Why can't
I be you? Or him or her?" The results are mixed as a novel, but Reuss succeeds in giving vivid shape to
Mohr's life—the major events (including possible WWII spy intrigue in China) and the mundane (taking
foxglove to keep his pulse regular). If not a man in full, the book contains a man kaleidoscopic.(May)
Copyright © Reed Business Information, a division of Reed Elsevier Inc. All rights reserved.

Review

"His aerialist's sense of history, his sleight of hand, his animal knowledge of political practice, his silver tact
and his cool tenderness make his performance nothing less than Orphic. Listen to it. "—JOHN BERGER,
BOOKER PRIZE WINNER

"[A] quiet triumph…what he has done -- first by following his own curiosity and then a trail of photographs
and letters -- is re-embody a couple pulled apart by a world of conflict. His book almost heals that rupture,
though in the end all it can do is give it a voice."—The San Francisco Chronicle

“Using the innovative format of speculative fiction based on a newly-discovered cache of fifty 1920s and
´30s vintage family photographs from playwright Max Mohr, novelist (Horace Afoot, The Wasties) Reuss
weaves a story of loss and longing, switching between Mohr, a German Jew who exiled himself to Shanghai,
and his wife Kathe and daughter Eva still in Germany as the Nazis are coming to full power…Told with skill
and beauty and haunted by the duo-toned photographs, Reuss captures the distanced writer bounding
between heroics and fatalism, his spirited wife and child, and their lives both separate and apart during a time
of the world gone mad. “—Historical Novels Review



“[An] unusual and thoughtful novel.”—The Boston Globe

“[An] unusual wartime love story….I was truly taken with the story’s beautiful dreamlike descriptions and
haunting foreboding of tragedy.”—Jewish Book World

“[R]eads like the best of Graham Greene, with the happy difference that Reuss does not wear his politics on
his sleeve. He is more concerned with how circumstances magnify the virtues and flaws of his well-drawn
characters. He imagines a life for Mohr which, if not verifiably factual, has the ring of deepest
humanity.”—The St. Louis Post Dispatch

“Very highly recommended reading as an original story of one man’s most intimate struggle with himself
and with the family he leaves behind.”—Midwest Book Review

“[A]n unusually close collaboration between fiction and fact. The book is driven, on one level, by a
psychological conundrum the documents cannot resolve. Mohr was Jewish, and for him to want to leave the
encroaching darkness of Nazi Germany seems understandable enough. And yet: How could he possibly have
left behind a beloved wife and daughter? But Reuss chose to highlight a different level of question, as well.
For he didn't just use that trove of photographs to inspire his storytelling -- he layered them into the novel
itself. "Mohr" is constructed around a selection of almost 50 images through which the story flows.”—The
Washington Post

"In 1934, facing Nazi persecution...Mohr packed his bags, said goodbye to his loyal wife and daughter, and
[left]...Reuss has spent 20 years trying to figure out why." —Washington City Paper

About the Author
Frederick Reuss is the acclaimed author of Horace Afoot, Henry of Atlantic City,

and The Wasties. He lives in Washington, DC, with his wife and two daughters.
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When a solitary man stumbles upon a cache of photographs, sometimes—and only sometimes—he can sense
the lives of the people in them. Sometimes he can find in their faces, and in the way they hold themselves or
the way they perform before the camera, the light trace of their story.

Following just that path, acclaimed novelist Frederick Reuss has created a love story of historic proportions.
Mohr: A Novel is about a man and wife whose life together is marked irreparably by a deeply troubled and
world-testing era.

With the sort of enthralling narrative step that always marks his work, Reuss allows their story to rise from a
cache of photographs he uncovered in Germany—photographs from the 1920s and ’30s of the exiled Jewish
playwright and novelist Max Mohr; Käthe, the beautiful wife he left behind; and Eva, their daughter, who
would live through it all but would never really understand what had happened.
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Most helpful customer reviews

8 of 8 people found the following review helpful.
"Smashing human connections is the easiest thing in the world to do."
By Mary Whipple



Max Mohr was one of author Frederick Reuss's distant relatives, his grandfather's favorite uncle--a
physician, friend of D. H. Lawrence, successful playwright, and novelist, who died mysteriously in Shanghai
in 1937. Reuss has spent years searching archives for information about Mohr, whose writings were burned
by the Nazis. He wants to know, especially, why Mohr left his wife and child, whom he apparently adored,
in rural Wolfsgrub, Germany, and, in 1934, set out for China, alone. Using a cache of almost fifty family
photographs to provide form for his novel, Reuss now reconstructs the engrossing story of Mohr and his wife
Kathe, some of it from letters, much of it imagined.

The result is an insightful story of identity, as Mohr reveals who he is, who he was, and who he might have
been. By alternating the setting and point of view between Mohr in Shanghai and his wife Kathe in
Wolfsgrub, Reuss establishes dramatic contrasts between Kathe's rural farm life and Max's frantic urban life
as he works as a physician during the Chinese civil war and China's battle against Japan. Gradually, the
reader recognizes Mohr's inherent contradictions: his apolitical nature but his pragmatism about his future as
a Jew in Germany; his naivete in traveling from China to Japan to climb Mount Fuji during Japan's war with
China; his love for Kathe and his daughter even as he begins a new relationship; his determination to save
lives in China during its war, while leaving his wife and half-Jewish daughter behind in Germany.

As time shifts back and forth, a full picture of Mohr evolves. Mohr recognizes that "he has no good
choices...that no good can possibly come from any path he chooses to take," whether he stays in China,
returns to his family, or moves elsewhere. "It is only the moment that is real. But it is also only the moment
that passes." Ultimately, the reader realizes that the lives of Mohr and Kathe involve a "question of separate
destinies, how to be together and apart at the same time."

In exceptionally clear, straightforward prose, Reuss creates an intimate portrait of Mohr and Kathe, while
making thoughtful observations about life and human nature. Wartime Shanghai, with all its horror, is seen
peripherally here--as it directly affects the life and thinking of Mohr--and when Mohr's story concludes in
1937, the reader is not surprised by the outcome. Ultimately, Mohr remains an enigma, a man who lived in
the moment and who, like most of us, can never really be known. As author Reuss journeys into the past, he
illustrates one of Kathe's observations about Mohr: "So much of who we are is also all that never was." Mary
Whipple

2 of 3 people found the following review helpful.
super insightful historical novel
By A Customer
Jewish author Dr. Max Mohr, whose latest work The Diamond Heart had just been serialized, leaves his
native Nazi Germany for war torn China. On the morning he is to depart from his home in the Tegernsee
Valley, his weary wife Kathe is sad as if she knows something about her spouse's journey. She wonders why
not some place closer like Prague unless they are to remain apart. Their young daughter Eva is excited as her
father says his two women will join him soon, but though mom does not dissuade her otherwise she feels that
is youthful foolishness. There he becomes a physician in Shanghai while his daughter waits word from him
to join him and his wife waits for something else.

Though feeling more like a memoir narrative told in alternating chapters in China (Max's adventures) and
Germany (the tales of Kathe and Eva) than a novel, biographical fiction readers will enjoy this interesting
look at the highly regarded playwright. The story line is pieced together from family photographs that
Frederick Reuss saw with approximately fifty included (part of why the book reads more like a memoir).
This is a well written and fascinating period piece that enables readers to compare mid 1930s Germany and
China with characters that seem so genuine that the audience can feel the pain of Kathe and the change from
euphoria to doubter in Eve. Many readers will be disappointed that Mr. Reuss finally cannot explain why



Mohr didn't take his family. Still this is a super insightful historical novel.

Harriet Klausner

2 of 2 people found the following review helpful.
From Germany to Shanghai
By ken liebeskind
Max Mohr was a German Jewish writer and doctor who left Germany for Shanghai in 1934 and died in
Shanghai in 1937. This is a fictionalized account of his story, full of actual photographs that follow the plot
as Mohr recounts his life in the German countryside where he lives on a farm with his wife, Kathe and
daughter, Eva. It's an idyllic life but fraught with despair as Mohr's books are banned by the Nazis and he is
forced to leave before the Holocaust starts. But he finds war in China as well when the Japanese attack and
as a doctor he spends time treating casualties, and eventually becomes one himself when he dies from a heart
attack, at least that's what we're told, but he may have been killed because he was Jewish. In China, he falls
in love with a nurse and they travel to Japan for a holiday. Mohr actually stays upbeat throughout, always
ready with a humorous comment for anyone he comes in contact with. He's not really concerned with his
Jewishness although the trauma he experiences is something he reflects on and becomes part of his
philosophy, which mixes upbeat humor with the emptiness of life in a cruel, cruel world. Kathe isn't Jewish
and remains in Germany, tending the farm and living amicably, but constantly thinking about Mohr,
reminiscing about their time together and wondering if they will ever see other again. The book combines the
events of their lives with their perceptions of them, which are sometimes philosophical, sometimes
bittersweet.

See all 5 customer reviews...
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